


1“To the angel of the church in Ephesus write:
The One who holds the seven stars in His 
right hand, the One who walks among the 
seven golden lampstands, says this:



2‘I know your deeds and your labor and 
perseverance, and that you cannot tolerate 
evil people, and you have put those who call 
themselves apostles to the test, and they are 
not, and you found them to be false; 3and you 
have perseverance and have endured on 
account of My name, and have not become 
weary. 



4But I have this against you, that you have left 
your first love. 5Therefore, remember from 
where you have fallen, and repent, and do 
the deeds you did at first; or else I am coming 
to you and I will remove your lampstand from 
its place—unless you repent. 
(Revelation 2:1-5 NASB)



“If anyone comes to Me and does not hate 
his own father, mother, wife, children, 
brothers, sisters, yes, and even his own life, 
he cannot be My disciple.” (Luke 14:26 NASB)



“Love the Lord your God with all your heart 
and with all your soul and with all your mind 
and with all your strength.” (Mark 12:30 NIV)



• Am I there?

• What do I do?
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